
Greetings Rattlers,

Today, you will learn the step-by-step process for completing your Online Housing Application. 

To review the video instructions please click on FAMU Online Application Process. 

For newly enrolled students, please keep in mind, in accordance with your Acceptance Letter to
FAMU, before you gain access to the housing application, you must have first paid your $150 
Admissions Deposit then your $200 Nonrefundable Housing Advanced Payment. 

If you have not done so, please refer back to your Acceptance Letter for instructions. 

For returning students, who do not currently live on campus, before you gain access to the housing 
application, you must have first paid your Admissions Deposit then your $200 Nonrefundable 
Housing Advanced Payment.

For more information regarding the $150 Admissions Deposit, please call us directly at 850-599-
3796 or email us at ugrdadmissions@famu.edu. 

For more information regarding the housing application process or Nonrefundable Housing 
Advanced Payment, please call us directly at 850-599-3651 or email us at 
famuhousing@famu.edu. 

If you have already paid your appropriate fees, it is time to apply for housing.

Be sure to review the Rental Rates and Student Housing Agreement at https://www.famu.edu/
students/living-on-campus/housing/apply-now.php.

https://youtu.be/-Gm8lef44b8?si=g__f4tyU09gkLKw0
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1. Click on FAMU Housing Apply Now Page then click "Apply for Housing/Login” to go to the FAMU
Online Housing Application.

https://www.famu.edu/students/living-on-campus/housing/apply-for-housing.php
https://famu.starrezhousing.com/StarRezPortal/9DB2C8E8/1/1/Home-Home


2. Click on the "LOGIN WITH YOUR FAMU ACCOUNT" link to the left of this page.



3. Utilizing your FAMU email address and password, log into the application portal.



4. Click on the "Click here to Apply" link in the upper left corner.



5. Click the “Apply” button next to the tern/semester you would like to apply for.



6. Fill in each space with the requested information.  Keep in mind, this is the information the
Office of University Housing will utilize to contact you with valuable updates including room
assignments, changes, etc. Then click “SAVE & CONTINUE”.



7. Your Emergency and Missing Person contact information is used to establish contact with a
parent, guardian or significant other if an emergency arises or if University Housing is unable to
reach you for an extended period of time. It is important that this information is accurate. When
complete click “SAVE & CONTINUE”.



8. The Standard Profile is used for roommate matching. Here, you will describe your preferred
room setting such as the level of noise, preferred temperature, and how late you prefer to
sleep. You will also use this section to list specific roommate preferences. Your preferred
roommate should provide you with the unique name indicated by the orange arrow below and
you should provide them with yours. University Housing will take these requests into
consideration during assignments. When complete, click “SAVE & CONTINUE”.

NOTE:  As indicated by the orange arrow below, you will need to provide this name to anyone 
who you are requesting to room with.  You will also need their Room Search Name.  This 
information will be requested later in the application process. 



9. The Evacuation Plan is used to note your plans in case of mandatory evacuation. Here you will
indicate the method you will use to leave the area. Then click “SAVE & CONTINUE”.



10. The Housing Agreement is your contract for the 2024-2025 school year. Please review this
document in its entirety. By completing the Housing Application, you are agreeing to the terms
of the contract.  You most us your FAMU Student ID Number to sign this agreement. If you are
18 or older, after you have completed this step, move to step 12.

NOTE:  If you are 17 or younger, please see the next step, Number 11. 



11. If you are 17 or younger when you start your application, you will be asked to have a
parent/guardian complete the "Florida A&M University (FAMU) Student Housing Agreement" 
via proxy. An email will be sent to your parent/guardian at the email address you have 
provided for approval.  You will not be able to continue with the remainder of the application 
process until this is complete. Please double check the email you provide for your parent/
proxy signature as they will not receive the email if the address is incorrect.





12. Select at least two room preferences.

Note: Space is limited, and the University cannot guarantee on-campus housing or assignment to 

a particular building, floor, or room. Housing is assigned on a first-come, first-served basis.



13. Here, you will see information previously noted such as your roommate search name, the
description you provided and any roommate groups you have been added to. In addition, you
can establish a roommate group and search according to the preferences you provided on your
profile.



14. If you are interested in residing within a Living Learning Community (first year students) or
Resident Development Community (second year and transfer students), you will complete the
steps below. Begin by clicking on your major in the highlighted links. This will take you to that
specific major’s application process. Complete the LLC/RDC application process, then click on
your major in the dropdown menu and click “OK”.



15. You have reached the last step in completing your housing application. Click “SUBMIT
APPLICATION.”

NOTE:  Until you click “SUBMIT APPLICATION” your application is incomplete. 



16. This page serves as your receipt for application submittal. Thank you for submitting your
housing application. Assignments will be completed at a later date. When you are assigned, you
may check back here for updates.




